
 
 

IRS Publishes New Tax-Exempt Organization Guidelines 
 

 On July 23, 2009, the Internal Revenue Service (IRS) 
released new governance training materials to provide 
guidance to agents concerning key issues to scrutinize 
when reviewing the governance of nonprofit hospitals 
and other exempt organizations by their controlling 
groups (e.g. boards of directors or boards of trustees). 
These new guidelines are part of the IRS’s aggressive 
promotion of its message that good governance practices 
are a critical component of a tax exempt organization 
and promote compliance with tax law.1  Through these 
new training guidelines, the IRS hopes to lessen the 
perceived disconnect between their message and the 
work done by their field agents.2  The guidelines clarify 
that it should be state Attorneys General who regulate 
nonprofit governance, and not the IRS. As such, there is 
no IRS mandate that a specific governance policy or 
practice is a prerequisite to obtaining or maintaining 
exemption.3  This new material is part of a trend of 
increased IRS scrutiny of exempt organization 
governance dating from early 2007 when it posted the 
Preliminary Staff Discussion Draft on good governance 
practices, used to create the governance section of Form 
990.4  
 

The guidelines include new training materials 
reinforcing that “one size does not fit all” for governance 
issues, and vary depending upon the type size, structure, 
and culture of the organization.5  There is a substantial 
focus on educating agents about governance structures, 
recognizing governance issues and ongoing oversight 
efforts, including the use of the Form 990 questions in 
developing compliance initiatives.6  These initiatives 
will allow the IRS to explore any correlation between 
governance and compliance with tax laws and will be 
used in a later project to develop additional compliance 
tools using input from exam agents and outside 
stakeholders.7  
 

The new guidelines make it clear that the duty of the IRS 
is to assess whether an organization is compliant with 
tax law.  In addition to looking for general 
noncompliance, IRS agents will examine whether 
organization managers participated in decisions resulting 
in excess benefits or whether the organization took 
certain steps to ensure the fairness of the arrangement to 
the exempt organization.8  Agents will also use the 
newly revised Form 990 to provide public transparency 
concerning an organization’s governance structure, 

9policies, and activities.   Part VI of the form relates to 
governance and is divided into three parts: governing 
body management policies, disclosure, and transparency 
of certain information. The new changes to Form 990 
include:  
 

• Exempt purpose and mission;  
• Number, composition, qualifications, authority, 

or duties of officers, key employees  or voting 
members; 

• Role of stockholders or membership in 
governance; 

• Distribution of assets upon dissolution; 
• Provisions to amend documents; 
• Quorum, voting rights or voting approval 

requirements; 
• Policies / procedures regarding compensation 

of officers, directors, trustees or key 
employees; conflicts of interest, 
whistleblowers, or document retention / 
destruction; and 

• Composition or procedures contained within 
organizing documents or bylaws of an audit 
committee.10  

 

These questions (especially regarding compensation) 
have traditionally been for charitable organizations, but 
the IRS will now ask all organizations seeking exempt 
status Form 990 questions and require responses to 
them.11  Compensation and other financial arrangements 
with the applicant organization’s officers, directors, 
trustees, employees and independent contractors are also 
detailed in part V of Form 1023.12  Form 990 will also 
be used as a tool for future compliance efforts by the 
IRS.13
 

The new guidelines can also be a reference for nonprofit 
organizations as they publicly emphasize areas of 
interest that have not been pronounced before, such as: 
an active and engaged board; appropriate board size and 
composition of primary independent members; 
mechanisms for allocating authority between board 
members and directors; mechanisms for documentation; 
and key policies addressing conflicts, whistleblower 
issues, document retention, compensation, and 
investments.14  
 

While the IRS does not mandate any specific 
procedures, these new areas of interest demonstrate that 
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the IRS is expanding its reach into all aspects of an 
exempt organization’s operations.  In special cases, the 
IRS will impose certain rules concerning board 
composition. Additionally, for tax-exempt hospitals the 
IRS will not allow the board to be dominated by the 
medical staff physicians. Overall, healthcare 
organization boards that are seeking tax exempt status or 
looking to renew existing status should be aware of 
increased governance and scrutiny by the IRS. 

5 Source: “EO Determinations CPE: Governance” Internal Revenue 
Service, PowerPoint Presentation, July 23, 2009, p. 4.  

6 Source: “Exempt Organizations: IRS Releases Governance Training 
  Materials, Provides Agents With Needed Exam Guidance,” BNA  
  Health Law Reporter, Vol. 18 (July 30, 2009) p. 1009. 
7 Source: “Exempt Organizations: IRS Releases Governance Training 
  Materials, Provides Agents With Needed Exam Guidance,” BNA  
  Health Law Reporter, Vol. 18 (July 30, 2009) p. 1009. 
8 Source: “Governance and Tax-Exempt Organizations: 2009 CPE 

Training” Internal Revenue Service, PowerPoint Presentation, July 
23, 2009, p.5. 

9 Source: “Governance and Tax-Exempt Organizations: 2009 CPE  
1 Source: “The Appropriate Role of the Internal Revenue Service with 
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Robert James Cimasi, MHA, ASA, FRICS, MCBA, AVA, CM&AA, serves 

as President of HEALTH CAPITAL CONSULTANTS (HCC), a nationally 

recognized healthcare financial and economic consulting firm headquartered in 

St. Louis, MO, serving clients in 49 states since 1993.  Mr. Cimasi has over 

thirty years of experience in serving clients, with a professional focus on the 

financial and economic aspects of healthcare service sector entities including: 

valuation consulting and capital formation services; healthcare industry 

transactions including joint ventures, mergers, acquisitions, and divestitures; 

litigation support & expert testimony; and, certificate-of-need and other 

regulatory and policy planning consulting. 
 

Mr. Cimasi holds a Masters in Health Administration from the University of Maryland, as well as 

several professional designations: Accredited Senior Appraiser (ASA – American Society of 

Appraisers); Fellow Royal Intuition of Chartered Surveyors (FRICS – Royal Institute of Chartered 

Surveyors); Master Certified Business Appraiser (MCBA – Institute of Business Appraisers); 

Accredited Valuation Analyst (AVA – National Association of Certified  Valuators and Analysts); and, 

Certified Merger & Acquisition Advisor (CM&AA – Alliance of Merger & Acquisition Advisors). He 

has served as an expert witness on cases in numerous courts, and has provided testimony before federal 

and state legislative committees. He is a nationally known speaker on healthcare industry topics, the 

author of several books, the latest of which include: “The U.S.  Healthcare Certificate of Need 

Sourcebook” [2005 - Beard Books], “An Exciting Insight into the Healthcare Industry and Medical 

Practice Valuation” [2002 – AICPA], and “A Guide to Consulting Services for Emerging Healthcare 

Organizations” [1999 John Wiley and Sons].  
 

Mr. Cimasi is the author of numerous additional chapters in anthologies; books, and legal treatises; 

published articles in peer reviewed and industry trade journals; research papers and case studies; and, is 

often quoted by healthcare industry press. In 2006, Mr. Cimasi was honored with the prestigious 

“Shannon Pratt Award in Business Valuation” conferred by the Institute of Business Appraisers.       

Mr. Cimasi serves on the Editorial Board of the Business Appraisals Practice of the Institute of 

Business Appraisers, of which he is a member of the College of Fellows. 

 

Todd A. Zigrang, MBA, MHA, ASA, FACHE, is the Senior Vice President of 

HEALTH CAPITAL CONSULTANTS (HCC), where he focuses on the areas 

valuation and financial analysis for hospitals and other healthcare enterprises. 

Mr. Zigrang has significant physician integration and financial analysis 

experience, and has participated in the development of a physician-owned 

multi-specialty MSO and networks involving a wide range of specialties; 

physician-owned hospitals, as well as several limited liability companies for 

the purpose of acquiring acute care and specialty hospitals, ASCs and other 

ancillary facilities; participated in the evaluation and negotiation of managed 

care contracts, performed and assisted in the valuation of various healthcare 

entities and related litigation support engagements; created pro-forma financials; written business 

plans; conducted a range of industry research; completed due diligence practice analysis; overseen the 

selection process for vendors, contractors, and architects; and, worked on the arrangement of financing. 
  

Mr. Zigrang holds a Master of Science in Health Administration and a Masters in Business 

Administration from the University of Missouri at Columbia, and is a Fellow of the American College 

of Healthcare Executives. He has co-authored “Research and Financial Benchmarking in the 

Healthcare Industry” (STP Financial Management) and “Healthcare Industry Research and its 

Application in Financial Consulting” (Aspen Publishers). He has additionally taught before the 

Institute of Business Appraisers and CPA Leadership Institute, and has presented healthcare industry 

valuation related research papers before the Healthcare Financial Management Association; the 

National CPA Health Care Adviser’s Association; Association for Corporate Growth; Infocast 

Executive Education Series; the St. Louis Business Valuation Roundtable; and, Physician Hospitals of 

America. 

 

Anne P. Sharamitaro, Esq., is the Vice President of HEALTH CAPITAL 

CONSULTANTS (HCC), where she focuses on the areas of Certificate of Need 

(CON); regulatory compliance, managed care, and antitrust consulting. Ms. 

Sharamitaro is a member of the Missouri Bar and holds a J.D. and Health Law 

Certificate from Saint Louis University School of Law, where she served as an 

editor for the Journal of Health Law, published by the American Health 

Lawyers Association. She has presented healthcare industry related research 

papers before Physician Hospitals of America and the National Association of 

Certified Valuation Analysts and co-authored chapters in “Healthcare 

Organizations: Financial Management Strategies,” published in 2008. 

HEALTH CAPITAL 

CONSULTANTS (HCC) is an 

established, nationally recognized 

healthcare financial and economic 

consulting firm headquartered in 

St. Louis, Missouri, with regional 

personnel nationwide. Founded in  

1993, HCC has served clients in 

over 45 states, in providing 

services  including: valuation in all 

healthcare sectors; financial 

analysis, including the  

development of forecasts, budgets 

and income distribution plans; 

healthcare provider related 

intermediary services, including 

integration, affiliation, acquisition 

and divestiture; Certificate of  

Need (CON) and regulatory 

consulting; litigation  support and 

expert witness services; and, 

industry research services for 

healthcare providers and their 

advisors. HCC’s accredited 

professionals are supported by an 

experienced research and library 

support staff to maintain a 

thorough and extensive knowledge 

of the healthcare reimbursement, 

regulatory, technological and 

competitive environment. 
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